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This leaflet provides important information 
about using HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP. You should also speak to 
your doctor or pharmacist if you would 
like further information or if you have any
concerns or questions about using 
HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP.

Where to find information in this 
leaflet:

1. Why am I using HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP?

2. What should I know before I use 
HYDROMORPHONE-HAMELN/ 
HYDROMORPHONE-HAMELN-HP?

3. What if I am taking other medicines?

4. How do I use HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP?

5. What should I know while using 
HYDROMORPHONE-HAMELN/ 
HYDROMORPHONE-HAMELN-HP?

6. Are there any side effects?

7. Product details

1. Why am I using 
HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP?

HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP contains the active 
ingredient hydromorphone hydrochloride.
Hydromorphone belongs to a group of 
medicines called opioid analgesics.

HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP is used to provide the 
short-term management of severe pain for
which other treatment options have failed 
or are otherwise inappropriate to provide 
sufficient management of pain.

2. What should I know before I use 
HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP?

Warnings

Do not use HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN/HYDROMORPHONE-
HAMELN-HP if:

• you are allergic to hydromorphone 
hydrochloride, or any of the ingredients 
listed at the end of this


